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April 13, 2021

Dear,

Mohammad Salehudin,

We would like to inform you that your manuscript with the ID 1315 has been accepted for
publication in PEGEGOG. (ISSN: 2146-0655, E-ISSN: 2148-239X),

Manuscript Title: Extending Indonesia Government Policy for E-Learning and Social Media
Usage
Thanks for submission of your work with us.

Regards,
Prof. Dr. Ismail Hakki Mirici

Editor in Chief
PEGEGOG



You have a new notification from Pegem Journal of Education and Instruction:

You have been added to a discussion titled "Reminder" regarding the
submission "Extending Indonesia Government Policy For E-Learning And Social
Media Usage".

Message Link:
http://www.pegegog.net/index.php/pegegog/authorDashboard/submission/1069

Sender: Pegegog Journal of Education and Instruction

For Frequently Asked Questions
Pegem Egitim ve Ogretim Dergisi

Dear Mohammad Salehudin,

The editing of your submission, "Extending Indonesia Government Policy For
E-Learning And Social Media Usage," is complete. We are now sending it to
production.

Submission URL:
http://www.pegegog.net/index.php/pegegog/authorDashboard/submission/1069

For Frequently Asked Questions
Pegem Egitim ve Ogretim Dergisi


http://www.pegegog.net/index.php/pegegog/authorDashboard/submission/1069
http://www.pegegog.net/index.php/pegegog/authorDashboard/submission/1069

Dear Author,
may i know who gave this account details to transfer. Now details are changed

On 2021-03-31 00:57, salehudin@iain-samarinda.ac.id wrote:
assalamualaikum

We have paid 400 USD for the article "Extending Indonesia Government
Policy For E-Learning And Social Media Usage".

We send proof of transfer to the account:
Pegem Yayincilik Academy

Tiirkiye Is Bankasi Kizilay Subesi

Sube Kodu: 4214

Suction Nu: 1112570

IBAN: TRO60006400000142141112570

best regards
author



Dear Author,
Is it possible to cancel payment?

On 2021-03-31 15:50, Salehudin wrote:
Dear editor

We got from this letter. to make these payments.
We send payments for these instructions.

Author

Sent from Android device

Pada tanggal 14 Mar 2021 17.37, Pegem Egitim ve Ogretim Dergisi
<editor@pegegog.net> menulis:
Dear Mohammad Salehudin:

We have reached a decision regarding your submission to Pegem
Journal of Education and Instruction, "Extending Indonesia
Government Policy For E-Learning And Social Media Usage".

Our decision is to: Accept Submission
Sayin Mohammad Salehudin,

Pegem Journal of Education and Instruction'ne gondermis

oldugunuz "Extending Indonesia Government Policy For E-Learning And
Social Media Usage" baslikli makaleniz redaksiyon hizmetine
gonderilmistir. Redaksiyon hizmetinin licretli bir hizmet

oldugunu hatirlatmak isteriz.

Redakte edilemeyecek durumda olan basvurularin dizeltilmesi igin
size geri gonderilecegini unutmayin. Bu kosulu kabul
etmiyorsaniz ivedilikle bildirmenizi rica ederiz.

Sizden redaksiyon bedeli olan 1200TL ve ek dizgi bedeli 300 TL'sini
(toplam 1500TL) asagida belirtilen hesaba 5 giin i¢inde
gondermenizi, dekont kopyasini adiniza fatura kesilebilmesi

i¢in dekontu ve adiniz soyadiniz, TC kimlik numaraniz, telefon
numaraniz ve adresinizi dizgi@pegegog.net adresine mail atmaniz
gerekmektedir. Ayrica dekontu lutfen Copyediting(redaksiyon)
b6liminde Add Disscussion (Tartisma A¢) diyerek Profreading

Fee (redaksiyon hizmet bedeli) dosya tiirini segerek yiikleyiniz.

Makaleniz lay igerisinde size gonderilerek son islemleri
yapilacak ve yayimlanacaktir.

Saygilaramla.

Hesap Numarasi.

Lutfen Ag¢iklama kismina "Pegegog Dergisi Profreading ve Ek

dizgi Hizmet Bedeli - Makale ID" seklinde ag¢iklama ekleyiniz.
(Ornek: "Pegegog Dergisi Profreading Hizmet Bedeli - 5555 ID 1i
Makale")

Pegem Akademi Yayincilik

Tiirkiye Is Bankasi Kizilay Subesi



Sube Kodu : 4214
Hesap Nu : 1112570

IBAN : TRO60006400000142141112570

For Frequently Asked Questions [1]
Pegem Egitim ve Ogretim Dergisi [2]

[1] http://www.pegegog.net/index.php/pegegog/faq
[2] http://www.pegegog.net/index.php/pegegog



http://www.pegegog.net/index.php/pegegog/faq
http://www.pegegog.net/index.php/pegegog

Dear Mohammad,

The issue will be released in about 10 days' time at the latest.

still need a letter of acceptance?

Prof. Dr. Ismail Hakki Mirici
Hacettepe University

Faculty of Education

Foreign Languages Teaching Department

06800, Beytepe
Ankara, Turkey

Editors in Chief:

International Online Journal of Education and Teaching (IOJET)
&

International Journal of Curriculum and Instruction (WCCI-IJCI)

World Council for Curriculum and Instruction (WCCI)
Past President
(2011-2013)

Ministry of National Education, Turkey
The European Language Portfolio-ELP
National Contact Person in CoE

E-mail : hakkimirici@gmail.com
Phone : +90 312 2978575, ext.126
Mobile : +90@ 532 3376385

Fax : 490 312 2976119

Do you

On Wed, Apr 14, 2021, 14:07 Salehudin <salehudin@iain-samarinda.ac.id>

wrote:


https://iain-samarinda.ac.id:2096/cpsess3966412298/horde/imp/dynamic.php?page=mailbox
https://iain-samarinda.ac.id:2096/cpsess3966412298/horde/imp/dynamic.php?page=mailbox

